
CITY OF CONCORD
CERTIFIED BID TABULATION FORM
STREETS PRESERVATION CONTRACT STR26 Bid No. 2675
LOCATION:    Brown Operations Center, Conference Room C, 635 Alfred Brown Jr Ct. Concord, NC 28026
TIME:        2:00 P.M.                   DATE:      May 6th, 2025

Contractor
N.C. License No.
Address
City, State  Zip
5% Bid Bond Included

No. Item Units Quantity Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total

1.1 Seal Existing pavement cracks and joints lbs 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2.1

Asphalt Full Depth Finished Patching - Place and compact 
Intermediate Course 3" I19.0B with 2" Surface Course S9.5 B Cap 
(areas to be determined) Tons 2,000

$146.00 $292,000.00 $235.00 $470,000.00 $150.00 $300,000.00 $155.00
$310,000.00

2.2
Asphalt Full Depth Patching - Place and compact  Intermediate 
Course I19.0B  (no Surface Course Cap) Tons 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

2.3 Asphalt Leveling - Place and compact  Intermediate Course I19.0B Tons 14,850 $115.00 $1,707,750.00 $126.00 $1,871,100.00 $105.50 $1,566,675.00 $105.00 $1,559,250.00

2.4
Asphalt Leveling - Place and compact Asphalt Open Graded Leveling 
Course (P78 or mix as approved by Director) Tons 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

2.5
Place and compact suitable Sub-base material  (Location to be 
determined) Cu. Yd. 500 $70.00 $35,000.00 $200.00 $100,000.00 $89.50 $44,750.00 $300.00 $150,000.00

2.6 Asphalt Seal Coat Sq. Yd. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
$2,034,750.00 $2,441,100.00 $1,911,425.00 $2,019,250.00

3.1 Full Mill the bituminous pavement - Depth 0” to 4”                 Sq. Yd. 136,050 $5.00 $680,250.00 $4.85 $659,842.50 $4.55 $619,027.50 $7.00 $952,350.00
3.2 Edge Mill the bituminous pavement - Depth 0” to 4”      Sq. Yd. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
3.3 Incidental Milling  0” to 6” Sq. Yd. 100 $25.00 $2,500.00 $15.00 $1,500.00 $20.00 $2,000.00 $12.00 $1,200.00

$682,750.00 $661,342.50 $621,027.50 $953,550.00

4.1 Reclamation of existing roadway with concrete stabilization Sq. Yd. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

4.2
Undercut and replace with approved suitable material for subgrade 
repairs Tons 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5.1
Asphalt Resurfacing - Place and compact 1.25” of Surface Course 
S9.5B Tons 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

5.2
Asphalt Resurfacing - Place and compact 1.5-2” of Surface Course 
S9.5B Tons 14,800 $117.00 $1,731,600.00 $128.00 $1,894,400.00 $116.50 $1,724,200.00 $108.00 $1,598,400.00

$1,731,600.00 $1,894,400.00 $1,724,200.00 $1,598,400.00

6.1
City of Concord Standard Valley Type Concrete Curb and Gutter 
(Incidental and as directed: LF 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

6.2
City of Concord Standard 2’-6” Concrete Curb and Gutter (Incidental 
and as directed): LF 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

6.3 Wheelchair Ramps (Incidental and as directed: Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
6.4 4” Thick Concrete Sidewalk Sq. Yd. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

7.1 Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines 4”  Double Yellow Solid LF 25,750 $3.20 $82,400.00 $0.90 $23,175.00 $2.35 $60,512.50 $4.00 $103,000.00

7.2
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines 4”  Yellow Solid, Skip, and 
Mini Skip Line   LF 350 $2.25 $787.50 $0.90 $315.00 $0.85 $297.50 $3.00 $1,050.00

7.3 Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines 8" Yellow Gore Line LF 115 $8.50 $977.50 $4.50 $517.50 $4.05 $465.75 $10.00 $1,150.00

7.4
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines 4" White Solid, Skip, and 
Mini Skip and Parking Stall Line LF 24,500 $2.50 $61,250.00 $0.90 $22,050.00 $0.85 $20,825.00 $3.00 $73,500.00

7.5 Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines STOP Bar - 24”                                LF 180 $24.00 $4,320.00 $12.00 $2,160.00 $15.05 $2,709.00 $28.00 $5,040.00
7.6 Temporary Painted Pavement Marking White and Yellow LF 27,000 $0.85 $22,950.00 $0.45 $12,150.00 $0.25 $6,750.00 $1.00 $27,000.00

7.7
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines Crosswalk, Hi-Visibility - 
24" White Bars NCDOT Std. LF 160 $24.00 $3,840.00 $12.00 $1,920.00 $15.05 $2,408.00 $28.00 $4,480.00

7.8 Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Yield Lane Symbol LF 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.9
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Thur, Right-Turn or Left-
Turn Arrow Ea. 26 $170.00 $4,420.00 $175.00 $4,550.00 $125.50 $3,263.00 $200.00 $5,200.00

7.10
Thermoplastic Pavment Marking Symbol Combo Arrow - Thur-Rt. / 
Thru-Lf. / Thru Rt. & Lf. Ea. 7 $230.00 $1,610.00 $175.00 $1,225.00 $301.25 $2,108.75 $270.00 $1,890.00

7.11
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Characters 8'-4" NCDOT 
Std. Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.12
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band 
NCDOT Std. Ea. 2 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $950.00 $1,900.00 $1,205.00 $2,410.00 $1,600.00 $3,200.00

7.13 Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.14
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane 
NCDOT Std. Ea. 75 $475.00 $35,625.00 $165.00 $12,375.00 $602.50 $45,187.50 $570.00 $42,750.00

7.15
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT 
Std. Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.16
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol 
NCDOT Std. Ea. 1 $400.00 $400.00 $450.00 $450.00 $555.00 $555.00 $450.00 $450.00

7.17 Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
7.18 Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.19
Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant 
Locations Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID

7.20 (Match Exisiting) - "Fire Lane" Red Box with White Lettering Ea. 2 $3,900.00 $7,800.00 $400.00 $800.00 $655.00 $1,310.00 $4,600.00 $9,200.00
7.21 Stamped Asphalt Decorative Crosswalk Ea. 10 $22,000.00 $220,000.00 $3,900.00 $39,000.00 $11,500.00 $115,000.00 $26,000.00 $260,000.00

$449,380.00 $122,587.50 $263,802.00 $537,910.00

$4,898,480.00 $5,119,430.00 $4,520,454.50 $5,109,110.00
$489,848.00 $511,943.00 $452,045.45 $510,911.00

$5,388,328.00 $5,631,373.00 $4,972,499.95 $5,620,021.00

This Certified Bid Tabulation is true and correct to the best of my abilities and knowledge. signed:  George Edwards Jr, PE

This is to certify that bids tabulated herein were publicly opened and read aloud at 2:00 p.m. on May 6, 2025, in the conference 
room at the Brown Operations Center at 635 Alfred Brown Jr. Ct. SW, Concord, North Carolina.

PO Box 480066 PO Box 670

Ferebee Corporation
18306

Blythe Brothers Asphalt 
Co. LLC

42840
1415 E Westinghouse Blvd

Charlotte, NC 28273
Yes Yes

TOTAL BID

J.T. Russell & Sons, Inc.
2767

Albermarle, NC 28002

Patching, Leveling, Asphalt Seal Coating

Blythe Construction Inc.

Charlotte, NC 28269

Milling

Reclamation 

Concrete

7639

Crack and Joint Sealing

PO Box 31635
Charlotte, NC 28231

BASE  BID SECTIONS SUBTOTAL

 + 10% CONTINGENCY

Yes Yes

Resurfacing

Re-Striping, Remarking. And Replace Pavement Marker


